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KWorld has launched the ultimate multi-use PC to HDTV converter 
 Share your PC files or search online important material during your  

presentation displayed on your HDMI TV in high definition  
 
 
 

Taipei, Taiwan – May 1st, 2011 - KWorld Computer Co., Ltd., a leading provider in 
integrated multimedia player today announces its latest design in multimedia converter – 
PT220-VH. KWorld has created this media converter to proportionate a multi-use function 
in your daily life at work or at home. This converter has very easy and convenient features 
that will allow you to share any PC files or search on the internet displayed on your HDMI 
TV in high definition while you are presenting or just sharing with your loved ones. 
 

 
PT220-VH will allow you more convenience for watching all your files on the big screen in 
the comfort of your living room or at your office for important meetings. You will be able 
to transmit your notebook image into your wide display TV with a high resolution up to 
1920*1200 60Hz by using VGA input of our convertor. PT220-VH will allow you to convert 
your notebook VGA input into your HDMI TV output 
 
KWorld has enhanced the feature of Plug and Play to give you the convenience of not 
needing to install any software. It is a great opportunity to easily connect your converter 
from your PC to your HDMI TV without the complicated process of installing any 
software. Meanwhile, in the package contents, 1.5M HDMI cable is contained for easy 
connection. KWorld PT220-VH will also let you have digital picture enhancement by 
displaying more colorful, bright and sharp pictures. You will also enjoy the convenience of 
not needing power adapter! Use the friendly environment USB power cable.   
 
KWorld Home Media Center brings more multimedia entertainment into users’ living 
room and at the office to share their passion, creativity and expertise with their family, 
friends and coworkers. It makes it so easy for users to watch different files and search on 
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the internet directly on your HDMI TV, turning your living-room or office into a media 
center! PT220-VH is available for media request now. 
 
About KWorld 
KWorld Computer Co., Ltd. is one of the leading brands in integrated digital multimedia 
solutions. By combining and integrating these six different kinds of multimedia solutions: 
PCTV, External TVBox, Multimedia Editing, Multimedia Converter, Home Media Center 
and Computer Speaker Series,  KWorld can be both the components and solutions for the 
basic infrastructure of a digital home entertainment center. For more information on 
KWorld, please visit www.kworld-global.com. 
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